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FDOT to Host Nov. 6 Public Meeting to Discuss Proposed Changes to 
Indigo Drive at Emerson Street 

 
JACKSONVILLE, Fla. – The Florida Department of Transportation (FDOT) will hold a 
public meeting Monday, Nov. 6 from 5 to 6 p.m. to discuss proposed changes to Indigo 
Drive at Emerson Street as part of a project to widen I-95 from Atlantic Boulevard to 
south of Emerson Street (FIN 432259-2). 
 
FDOT proposes installation of a cul-de-sac where Indigo Drive currently connects to 
Emerson Street. This change will mitigate a sight distance issue associated with the 
JEA lift station located at the southwest corner of the Emerson Street/Indigo Drive 
intersection. Construction of the cul-de-sac is expected to begin in 2024. 
 
The meeting will take place virtually and in-person at the FDOT Jacksonville Urban 
Office, 2198 Edison Avenue, Jacksonville, FL 32204. Staff and consultants will be 
available from 5 to 6 p.m. to answer questions and accept comments. A formal 
presentation and public comment period will begin at 6 p.m. Project documents and 
virtual participation instructions are available at nflroads.com/VPH. Participants who are 
unable to attend the webinar virtually or in-person may listen to the meeting by calling 
(562) 247-8422 and entering access code 464-904-901.  
 
Both virtual and in-person participants will be given equal opportunity to ask questions 
and make oral statements for the project record. Written statements or other exhibits 
may be submitted in the comments section at nflroads.com/VPH or by directing them to 
Will Lyons, Project Manager, at Will.Lyons@dot.state.fl.us or 2198 Edison Avenue, 
Jacksonville, FL 32204. All exhibits or statements postmarked by Nov. 16, 2023 will 
become part of the public hearing record. 
 
Stay informed about lane closures and roadwork in your area by following FDOT District 
2 at @MyFDOT_NEFL on Twitter, at MyFDOTNEFL on Facebook or by visiting 
nflroads.com. Drivers seeking real-time traffic alerts may visit www.FL511.com or 
download the FL511 app. 
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